
BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12

BIDDERS
 Alto Sax 
YAS-480

 Baritone 
Sax YBS-

480

Selmer 
Bass 

Clarinet 
1430LP

 Clarinet 
YCL-650

 Tenor Sax 
PMST-
56GC 

 Clarinet 
YCL-650II

 Clarinet 
YCL-255

Flute YFL-
697H

Flute YFL-
222 Piccolo 

YPC-32

Bass 
Clarinet 

JBC1000N

Contrabas
s Clarinet 

7182
Alto Music $1,947.00 $6,278.99 $1,964.00 $1,517.00 $2,500.00 $1,517.00 $450.00 $3,027.00 $450.00 $647.00 NB $5,110.00
Art's Music $2,037.00 $4,979.00 $2,014.00 $1,587.00 NB $1,587.00 $496.00 $3,165.00 $472.00 $678.00 $1,635.00 $5,224.00
Boothe Music $820.00 $3,313.00 NB $988.00 $1,439.00 $988.00 $327.00 NB $327.00 $644.00 $1,701.00 NB
Leitz Music  5%LP NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB MB NB
MRW 5% LP NB NB NB NB $1,545.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Playground 3% LP $2,050.00 $5,005.00 $1,950.00 $1,595.00 NB $1,595.00 $499.00 $3,180.00 $475.00 $682.00 $1,697.00 $4,999.00
Sweetwater sound $2,027.00 $4,955.00 $2,044.00 $1,579.00 $1,545.00 $1,579.00 $495.00 $3,150.00 $470.00 $674.00 $1,680.00 $5,305.00
Washington Music $1,873.60 $4,580.65 $1,896.10 $1,460.25 $1,460.25 $1,460.25 $388.10 $2,911.80 $369.30 $623.90 $1,538.85 $4,918.75

Mowat 1 Y LP LP
Bay 2 Jupiter

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23 24

Alto Sax Ea   

Bass 
Clarinet 
YCL 221

Tenor Sax 
ETS-281

Oboe 
YOB-241

Clarinet 
Swabs 

YAC2051P 

Flute 
Swabs 

YAC1063P

Alto Sax 
Swabs 

YAC2053P

Tenor Sax 
Swabs 

Monster 
Swab

Baritone 
Sax 

YACBSMS
Padded sax 

straps
Baritone 

Sax Straps

Bass 
Clarinet 

mouthpiec
e

NB $1,900.00 NB $1,500.00 $17.00 $4.00 $16.00 $27.50 $29.00 $17.00 $31.00 $32.00
$807.00 $2,060.00 $994.00 $1,643.00 $11.40 $5.10 $21.00 $24.00 $36.00 NB NB $47.00
$820.00 $1,701.00 $1,137.00 $1,991.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$725.00 $2,070.00 $944.00 $1,650.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
$775.00 $2,049.00 $1,030.00 $1,635.00 $9.75 $5.00 $18.00 $19.50 $29.00 $12.50 $14.50 $34.00

NB $1,894.00 NB $1,511.20 $8.10 $3.60 $14.85 NB $25.45 NB NB $31.15



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

25 26 27 28 29 30 31 32 33 34 35 36

Baritone 
Sax 

mouthpiece
Bassoon 

M20C
Bassoon 

Model 222

Buffet 
Clarinet 

E13
Piccolo 
PFP105

Buffet 
Clarinet

Flute 
Armstrong 

104

EEB Contra 
Alto Bass 
Clarinet 

7168

Leblanc 
Bass 

Clarinet 
7168

Tenor Sax 
LaBrava 200

Clarinet MP 
B45

Alto Sax MP 
C*

$42.00 NB $6,500.00 NB $845.00 NB $325.00 $5,200.00 $1,986.00 $1,900.00 $95.00 $175.00
$57.00 NB $6,876.00 NB ? $914.00 $541.00 DC NB NB ? $2,014.00 $2,010.00 $117.00 $210.00

NB $4,480.00 $4,480.00 $988.00 $644.00 $327.00 $327.00 NB $1,701.00 $1,849.00 NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB $2,599.00 NB $546.00 NB NB NB $1,958.00 NB NB
NB NB $6,565.00 $1,505.00 $885.00 $565.00 DC NB NB $1,950.00 $1,970.00 $90.00 $175.00

$41.00 NB $6,563.00 $2,599.00 $875.00 $530.00 $375.00 $2,044.00 $2,044.00 $1,781.00 $86.00 $173.00
$37.95 NB $6,548.85 $2,377.75 $811.50 $472.05 NB $1,896.10 $1,896.10 NB $78.80 $149.75

NB LP LP



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

37 38 39 40 41 42 43 44 45 46 47 48

Baritone 
Sax 

EBS640-GL
Tuba 

EBB226
Tuba 

EBB534S

Tuba 
EBB534 

Gold
Tromebone 

YSL-620
Sousaphon
e EPH495S

Trumpet 
YTR6345G

Fluglehorn 
YFH631G

Trumpet 
YTR2330

Tromebone 
YSL354

Euphonium 
YEP642sII

Double Horn 
YHR671

NB NB NB NB $1,830.00 NB $1,720.00 $1,590.00 $739.00 $639.00 $5,722.00 $4,052.00
DC NB $3,373.00 $5,130.00 $4,456.00 $1,890.00 $5,006.00 $1,799.00 $1,662.00 $670.00 $670.00 $5,982.00 $4,236.00

$4,142.00 $5,076.00 NB $4,045.00 NB NB $1,020.00 $887.00 $433.00 $476.00 $3,342.00 $2,564.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$2,287.00 $3,200.00 $4,881.00 $4,228.00 $1,899.00 $4,750.00 $1,913.00 $1,670.00 $673.00 $673.00 $6,010.00 $4,524.00
$3,273.00 $3,996.00 $6,058.00 $5,014.00 $2,089.00 $6,308.00 $1,895.00 $1,654.00 $770.00 $875.00 $5,953.00 $4,481.00

NB NB NB NB $1,931.30 NB $1,751.50 $1,528.50 $605.40 $687.10 $5,502.55 $3,897.15
SUB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

49 50 51 52 53 54 55 56 57 58 59 60

Mellophone 
YMP204M

Sousaphone 
YSH411SW

C
Tuba 

EBC832

French 
Horn Conn 

8D
Trumpet 
YTR2320

Tuba 
EBB231

Tuba 
EBB234

Tuba 
STP202N

Euphoniu
m YEP201

Sousaphon
e shoulder 

pad

Bass 
Tromebone 

TBQ36R

Trumpet 
King 

1117SP

$1,504.00 $7,926.00 NB $4,300.00 $639.00 NB NB NB $1,857.00 $32.00 NB $1,370.00
$1,443.00 $8,551.00 $5,508.00 $4,361.00 $670.00 $2,261.00 $2,376.00 NB $1,944.00 $41.00 $2,492.00 $1,394.00
$1,402.00 $6,386.00 NB NB $433.00 $2,588.00 $2,588.00 NB $1,371.00 NB NB $550.00

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$1,581.00 $8,290.00 $5,383.00 $4,095.00 $673.00 $2,065.00 $2,210.00 NB $1,953.00 NB $2,393.00 $1,350.00
$1,566.00 $8,211.00 $6,145.00 $4,428.00 $665.00 $2,556.00 $2,556.00 $3,648.00 $1,934.00 $28.50 NB $1,415.00
$1,447.75 $7,590.50 NB $4,306.75 $523.70 NB NB NB $1,788.05 NB NB $1,312.55

LP



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

61 62 63 64 65 66 67 68 69 70 71

Tromebon
e ETB428

Trombone 
YSL448G

Euphoniu
m King 
2280

Sousapho
ne 

JSP1010S
Trumpet 
MP 5C

Trombone 
MP 1G

Trombone 
MP 1 1/4G

Trombone 
MP 1 

1/4GM

Snare 
Stand 

MSS3000
Tenor Stand 

MTS3000

Bass 
Stand 

MBS3000
NB $1,375.00 $2,400.00 NB $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $200.00 $250.00 $250.00

$928.00 $1,518.00 $2,481.00 $4,718.00 $74.50 $74.50 $74.50 $74.50 NB NB NB
NB $1,060.00 NB $4,907.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$880.00 $1,526.00 $2,375.00 $4,895.00 NB NB NB NB $210.00 $240.00 $230.00
$1,283.00 $1,511.00 $2,519.00 $4,848.00 $51.00 $67.00 $67.00 $67.00 $210.00 $234.00 $233.00

NB $1,396.80 $2,336.15 $4,439.55 $42.50 $55.60 $55.60 $55.60 $195.40 $217.90 $216.90
LP



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

72 73 74 75 76 77 78 79 80 81 82

Snare Drum  
short holder 
PEAMUH20

Snare Drum 
long holder 
PEAMUH10

Marimba 
Octave 

ADMMCKF43

Xylophone 
ADMXSFK

F35

Low 
Octave 
Crotale 

ZILP0625

18" 
Cymbals 

SWCYM18
MP

Cymbal 
Straps 

SWCYMS
TRAP

Cymbal 
Pads 

ZILPO751

China 
Cymbal 

HHX

Vibraphone 
Musser 3 
Octave

Triangle 
ABL6TRI

$40.00 $40.00 $5,100.00 $3,100.00 $1,350.00 NB NB $13.00 $290.99 $5,000.00 NB
NB NB $5,026.00 $2,962.00 NB NB NB NB NB $4,838.00 NB
NB NB $4,202.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB $2,500.00 NB NB $20.00 480.00 ? NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$50.00 $50.00 $5,095.00 $2,995.00 $1,404.00 NB NB NB NB $4,699.00 NB
$40.00 $40.00 $5,109.00 $3,039.00 $1,815.00 NB NB $14.00 NB $4,912.00 $20.00
$35.85 $35.85 $4,717.60 $2,779.85 $1,915.25 NB NB $12.25 NB $4,555.25 NB

NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

83 84 85 86 87 88 89 90 91 92 93 94
Bass Drum 
Stand YAM 
RM MASH 

B
Giro 

LP243
Timbales  
M257B

Triangle 
PET80

Trap Table 
PTT1524M

PW
Drum Key 

K080

Snare 
Carrier 

RMABSFS

Wind 
Chimes 

TWTRE421

Temple 
Blocks 

PEAPCWT
BO5

Timpani 
Mallets 
VICT1

Marimba 
Mallets 
ENC 

GRADB

Triangle 
Beater 
STO1

$187.50 $39.00 $442.00 $45.00 $225.00 $9.00 $300.00 $70.00 $260.00 $27.00 NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB $54.00 NB NB NB NB
NB $31.00 $331.00 NB NB NB NB $75.00 NB NB NB NB
NB $50.00 $550.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB $40.00 NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB $40.00 $410.00 $80.00 $205.00 $15.00 NB NB $275.00 NB NB NB

$185.00 $33.00 $378.00 $45.00 $199.00 $10.00 $262.00 $49.00 $255.00 $24.00 NB NB
$177.10 $40.00 $463.10 $41.95 $186.20 $7.20 $251.40 $67.90 NB $29.40 NB NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

95 96 97 98 99 100 101 102 103 104 105
Tuba 
Stand 
K&M 

14950

Drum Set 
Pearl 

Export Exx

Marching 
Snare MS 

6300
Snare Drum 
CSM1350AII

Gong 
Stand 
Weiss

Drum Stick 
bag SP3

Snare 
Bags 
MSH1

Bass Drum 
holder 

MBMH2

Marching 
Snare 

MS9414C
H

Marching 
Tenor w/ 
Carrier 
and Stand

16" Marching 
Bass Drum 
w/ Carrier 
and Stand

$78.00 $710.00 $220.00 $350.00 NB NB $16.00 $11.00 $1,200.00 $1,685.00 $920.00
B NB NB $354.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
$130.00 $799.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB $635.00 $277.00 $490.00 NB $215.00 NB NB $1,052.00 $1,757.00 $803.00

$86.00 $639.00 219.00 ? $354.00 NB NB $16.00 $12.00 $1,030.00 $1,699.00 $776.00
NB NB $203.35 $325.45 NB NB NB $9.00 $963.25 $1,571.30 $718.10



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

106 107 108 109 110 111 112 113 114 115
18" Marching 
Bass Drum 
w/ Carrier 
and Stand

20" Marching 
Bass Drum 
w/ Carrier 
and Stand

22" Marching 
Bass Drum 
w/ Carrier 
and Stand

26" Marching 
Bass Drum 
w/ Carrier 
and Stand

16" Marching 
Cymbals 

AQ2 Bop 
Titanium 
Quartz Drum 
Set 14" Hi Hat 

18" Crash 
Cymbal

20" Ride 
Cymbal

22" FX 
Oriental 
Crash of 
Doom 

$920.00 $940.00 $1,015.00 $1,100.00 $330.00 $1,070.00 $360.00 $250.00 $410.00 $295.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB $280.00 NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB $500.00 $999.00 $500.00 $380.00 NB $380.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$831.00 $860.00 $888.00 $973.00 $322.00 NB $353.00 $242.00 $365.00 $261.00
$804.00 $831.00 $858.00 $940.00 $359.00 $819.00 $379.00 $264.00 $399.00 $272.00
$743.10 $768.60 $793.60 $869.55 $344.40 NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

116 117 118 119 120 121 122 123 124 125

Hi Hat Stand Timpani 

Marching 
Snare Drum

Marching 
Tenor Set

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
16"

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
18"

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
20"

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
22"

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
24"

Marching 
Snare Drum 
Cover

$236.00 $13,100.00 $975.00 $2,282.00 $730.00 $787.00 $820.00 $833.00 $899.00 $63.00
NB $13,203.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$250.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB $13,300.00 $1,020.00 $2,395.00 $790.00 $810.00 $850.00 $875.00 $945.00 $70.00

$240.00 $13,399.00 $1,002.00 $2,991.00 $752.00 $795.00 $846.00 $865.00 $935.00 $64.00
NB $12,431.55 $917.05 $2,095.25 $687.55 $726.90 $773.95 $790.30 $855.60 $57.30



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

126 127 128 129 130 131 132 133 134 135

Marching 
Tenor Set 
Cover

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
16" - Cover

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
18" - Cover

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
20" - Cover

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
22" - Cover

Marching 
Bass Drum - 
24" - Cover

Marching Bass 
Drum Mallet 
Holder w/Rim 
Savers

Marching 
Tenors Multi-
Use Holder

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Accessory 
Mount

Marching 
Snare Drum 
Carier

$83.00 $68.00 $68.00 $76.00 $76.00 $83.00 $76.00 $42.00 $49.90 $325.00
NB NB NB NB NB $90.00 NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$95.00 $80.00 $80.00 $85.00 $85.00 $90.00 $85.00 $55.00 $60.00 $340.00
$85.00 $67.00 $67.00 $73.00 $73.00 $77.00 $73.00 $39.00 $47.00 $335.00
$75.70 $59.35 $59.35 $65.50 $65.50 $71.65 $65.50 $35.85 $43.00 $311.00



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

136 137 138 139 140 141 142 143 144 145

Marching 
Tenor Set 
Carrier

Marching 
Snare/Tenors 
Plus Size 
Carrier Add-On

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Carrier

Marching Bass 
Drum Plus Size 
Carrier Add-On

Marching 
Snare Drum 
Case

Marching 
Tenors Case

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Case - 16"

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Case - 18"

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Case - 20"

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Case - 22"

$370.00 $135.00 $325.00 $170.00 $90.00 $210.00 $93.00 $93.00 $118.00 $138.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$395.00 NB $360.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
$387.00 $139.00 $348.00 $168.00 $129.00 $265.00 $128.00 $139.00 $169.00 $189.00
$360.10 $127.90 $324.30 $156.55 NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

146 147 148 149 150 151 152 153 154 155

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Case - 24"

Large Drum 
Hardware 
Case 
w/Wheels

2.5 Octave 
Xylophone 
Kit

3.0 Practice 
Xylphone

Marching 
Snare Sticks

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Mallets - 
Extra Small

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Mallets - 
Small

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Mallets - 
Medium

Marching 
Snare Drum 
Heads

Marching 
Tenor Heads 
Pack

$225.00 $240.00 $645.00 $846.00 $11.00 $37.00 $38.00 $38.00 $83.00 $71.50
NB NB $630.00 $805.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB $13.00 $36.00 $40.00 $40.00 95.00 ? $75.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB $647.00 DC NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$219.00 $275.00 $660.00 $800.00 $13.00 $36.00 $36.00 $39.00 NB NB
NB NB $612.40 $740.70 $12.70 $38.50 $39.90 $43.30 NB NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

156 157 158 159 160 161 162 163 164 165

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Heads - 16"

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Heads - 18"

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Heads - 20"

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Heads - 22"

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Heads - 24"

Bass Drum 
Tone Foam

Concert Tom 
Set Marching 

Bass Drum
Crash 
Cymbals

10" China 
Splash 
cymbal

$27.00 $27.50 $29.00 $32.00 $36.00 $12.00 $1,245.00 $345.00 $63.00 $50.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1,244.00 NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$37.00 $43.00 $46.00 $50.00 $55.00 NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1,276.00 NB NB NB

$30.00 $34.00 $37.00 $40.00 $44.00 $14.00 $1,262.00 $333.00 $272.00 NB
$32.55 $33.75 $35.75 $39.00 $44.80 $10.00 $1,171.30 NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

166 167 168 169 170 171 172 173 174 175

Marching 
snare 
cowbell

Complete 
drumset with 
cymbals 

72" Marching 
Band Podium

Keyboard 
Synthesizer 
Workstation

Synthesizer 
Cart

Launchpad 
Pro Grid 
Controler

Launchkey 
Mini

Wireless PA 
Set

Wireless PA 
Speaker

Wireless PA 
Companion 
Speaker

$34.22 $514.00 NB $1,650.00 $1,000.00 $95.00 $89.00 NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB $799.00 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB $480.00 NB $1,080.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB

$24.00 $469.00 NB NB NB $340.00 $109.00 $3,159.00 $1,629.00 $797.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

176 177 178 179 180 181 182 183 184 185

Speaker 
Stands w/ 
Carry Bag

Speaker 
Stands GPA 
TOTE 12

Wireless 
Microphone

Wireless 
Bodypack 
Transmitter

Headworn 
Microphone

Bb Clarinet 
Size 3 Box of 
10 REEDS

Bass Clarinet 
Size 3 Box of 
5 REEDS

Alto 
Saxophone 
Size 3 Box of 
10 REEDS

Tenor 
Saxophone 
Size 3 Box of 
5 REEDS Stick Bag

$128.00 $60.00 NB NB NB $23.00 $23.00 $23.00 $23.00 $38.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$140.00 $60.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$143.00 $83.00 $360.00 $265.00 $90.00 $24.00 $22.00 $30.00 $21.00 $36.00
NB NB NB NB NB $19.60 $18.40 $25.05 $18.20 $32.75



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

186 187 188 189 190 191 192 193 194 195

Metronome/D
rone

Long 
Ranger/Speak
er Amplifier

Clarinet 
Mouthpiece 

Trumpet 
Mouthpiece

Mellophone 
Mouthpiece

Trombone 
Mouthpiece 
5G

Trombone 
Mouthpiece 
4G

Horn 
Mouthpiece 
725G US

Horn 
Mouthpiece 
725G EU

$139.99 NB $780.00 $95.00 $33.00 $48.00 $68.00 $68.00 $65.00 $65.00
NB NB NB $117.00 $44.40 NB $74.50 $74.50 NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$160.00 NB $1,000.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$106.00 NB $729.00 $90.00 $35.00 NB $64.00 $64.00 $86.00 NB
$127.40 NB $851.65 $78.80 $31.40 NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

196 197 198 199 200 201 202 203 204 205

Tuba 
Mouthpiece 
BACH 18

Tuba 
Mouthpiece 
HELLEBERG 
120S

Soprano 
Metallophone 
with Mallets 
(MPS-16-U)

Alto 
Xylophone 
with Mallets  
(XPA-16-U)

Bass 
Xylophone 
with Mallets 
(XPB-16-U)

Midi 
Keyboard

Hanging 
Folders for 
Music 
Storage, 

Sousaphone 
Case

Omegasonic
s Ultrasonic 
Cleaner

Bose 
Portable PA 
System with 
Bluetooth

$89.00 $77.00 $215.00 $295.99 $475.00 $96.00 NB NB NB $1,590.00
$95.50 $87.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB $1,795.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$82.00 $71.00 $329.00 $425.00 $675.00 NB NB $429.00 NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

206 207 208 209 210 211 212 213 214 215

Shure SM57
 GEARLUX 
XLR 20-25 ft

 GEARLUX 
XLR 10 ft

Microphone 
Stand

Microphone 
Wind Screen

Trombone 
mouthpiece   
1 1/2 G

Trombone 
mouthpiece 1 
1/2 GM

Trombone 
mouthpiece 
BL-YEO-GP

Classic 
Trombone 
stand

Trumpet 
stand

$81.00 $56.00 $38.00 $84.00 $14.00 $68.00 $68.00 $155.00 $30.00 $23.00
NB NB NB NB NB $74.50 $74.50 NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 

$95.00 $23.00 $20.00 $130.00 $20.00 NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 

$87.00 $21.00 $20.00 $119.00 $14.00 $67.00 $67.00 $145.00 $27.00 $42.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 

SUB



BID REQUEST 23-03 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Alto Music
Art's Music
Boothe Music
Leitz Music  5%LP
MRW 5% LP
Playground 3% LP
Sweetwater sound
Washington Music

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

216 217 218 219

Omnidirectional 
Dynamic Vocal 
Microphone

Popper 
stopper wind 
screen for 
SM58

Microphone 
Pop Filter 
Windshield / 
wind foam

Service/ 
Repair/ Refur 

per hr
GRAND 
TOTAL

$115.00 $6.00 NB NB
NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB

$145.00 $33.00 $13.00 NB
NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB 65.00 HR

$145.00 NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB

SUB


	Sheet1

